

Summary Bid Tabulation											
ITB 10056901-15-L											
Item No.		Baker & Taylor	Brodart Company	Ingram Library Services	Cengage Learning	Center Point Large	Theodore Front	Midwest Tape	Blackstone Audio	Recorded Books	
Section 1.1: Materials Pricing											
1	Adult Fiction, Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 143,910.00	\$ 144,450.00	\$ 140,400.00	\$ 270,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
2	Adult Non Fiction, Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 143,910.00	\$ 144,450.00	\$ 140,400.00	\$ 270,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
3	Adult Fiction, Trade Paperback Books	\$ 62,532.00	\$ 62,640.00	\$ 62,640.00	\$ 108,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
4	Adult Non Fiction, Trade Paperback Books	\$ 187,596.00	\$ 187,920.00	\$ 187,920.00	\$ 324,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
5	Small Press Books	\$ 48,006.00	\$ 48,060.00	\$ 45,900.00	\$ 54,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 96,012.00	\$ 96,120.00	\$ 91,800.00	\$ 108,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
7	Large Print Books	\$ 17,269.20	\$ 17,334.00	\$ 27,540.00	\$ 25,920.00	\$ 19,440.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 16,394.40	\$ 16,632.00	\$ 17,712.00	\$ 21,600.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 25,920.00	\$ 25,056.00	\$ 25,056.00	\$ 43,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 115,128.00	\$ 115,560.00	\$ 112,320.00	\$ 216,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 62,532.00	\$ 62,640.00	\$ 62,640.00	\$ 108,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
12	Board Books	\$ 8,910.00	\$ 8,667.00	\$ 13,284.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 114,760.80	\$ 116,424.00	\$ 123,984.00	\$ 151,200.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 19,440.00	\$ 18,792.00	\$ 18,792.00	\$ 32,400.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Subtotal 1-14: Section 1.1, Material Pricing Including Sales Tax (8%)		\$ 1,062,320.40	\$ 1,064,745.00	\$ 1,070,388.00	\$ 1,732,320.00	\$ 19,440.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	
Subtotal 1-14: Section 1.2, Processing Services		\$ 97,576.35	\$ 179,985.25	\$ 128,565.35	\$ -	\$ 26,580.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	
Subtotal 1-14: Section 1.1 Including Sales Tax, and Section 1.2		\$ 1,159,896.75 Low	\$ 1,244,730.25	\$ 1,198,953.35	\$ 1,732,320.00	\$ 46,020.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	
15	Music Compact Discs	\$ 58,239.00 Low	No Bid	\$ 59,940.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 60,750.00	No Bid	No Bid	
16	DVD's	\$ 219,996.00 Low	No Bid	\$ 226,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 226,800.00	No Bid	No Bid	
17	Spoken Word Audio	\$ 57,888.00 Low	No Bid	\$ 58,320.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 108,000.00	\$ 86,400.00	\$ 86,400.00	
18	Music Scores	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9,180.00 Low	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 9,720.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
Subtotal 15-18: Section 1.1, Material Pricing Including Sales Tax (8%)		\$ 336,123.00	\$ -	\$ 354,240.00	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9,720.00	\$ 395,550.00	\$ 86,400.00	\$ 86,400.00	
Subtotal 15-18: Section 1.2, Processing Services		\$ 35,029.50	\$ -	\$ 52,196.75	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 53,216.25	\$ -	\$ -	
Subtotal 15-18: Section 1.1 Including Sales Tax, and Section 1.2		\$ 371,152.50	\$ -	\$ 406,436.75	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 9,720.00	\$ 448,766.25	\$ 86,400.00	\$ 86,400.00	
Grand Total Section 1.1 Including Sales Tax, and Section 1.2:		\$ 1,531,049.25	\$ 1,244,730.25	\$ 1,605,390.10	\$ 1,732,320.00	\$ 46,020.00	\$ 9,720.00	\$ 448,766.25	\$ 86,400.00	\$ 86,400.00	

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Baker & Taylor			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	46.70%	\$ 133,250.00	\$ 143,910.00	1	8,900	\$ 1.29	\$ 11,481.00	\$ 155,391.00
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	46.70%	\$ 133,250.00	\$ 143,910.00	1	9,615	\$ 0.58	\$ 5,576.70	\$ 149,486.70
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.10%	\$ 57,900.00	\$ 62,532.00	2	6,200	\$ 2.03	\$ 12,586.00	\$ 75,118.00
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	42.10%	\$ 173,700.00	\$ 187,596.00	2	14,285	\$ 2.03	\$ 28,998.55	\$ 216,594.55
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	11.10%	\$ 44,450.00	\$ 48,006.00	3**	2,500	\$ 0.58	\$ 1,450.00	\$ 49,456.00
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	11.10%	\$ 88,900.00	\$ 96,012.00	3**	1,750	\$ 0.58	\$ 1,015.00	\$ 97,027.00
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	46.70%	\$ 15,990.00	\$ 17,269.20	1***	1,200	\$ 0.58	\$ 696.00	\$ 17,965.20
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	24.10%	\$ 15,180.00	\$ 16,394.40	4	1,120	\$ 0.58	\$ 649.60	\$ 17,044.00
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	40.00%	\$ 24,000.00	\$ 25,920.00	5	5,000	\$ 0.23	\$ 1,150.00	\$ 27,070.00
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	46.70%	\$ 106,600.00	\$ 115,128.00	6	9,500	\$ 1.17	\$ 11,115.00	\$ 126,243.00
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.10%	\$ 57,900.00	\$ 62,532.00	7	8,700	\$ 2.03	\$ 17,661.00	\$ 80,193.00
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	45.00%	\$ 8,250.00	\$ 8,910.00	8	2,100	\$ 0.38	\$ 798.00	\$ 9,708.00
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	24.10%	\$ 106,260.00	\$ 114,760.80	9	5,900	\$ 0.58	\$ 3,422.00	\$ 118,182.80
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	40.00%	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 19,440.00	5	4,250	\$ 0.23	\$ 977.50	\$ 20,417.50

Bid Tabulation												
ITB 10056901-15-L												
Baker & Taylor			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing					Section 1.2: Processing Services				
			Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2	
Item No	Type of Material											
				Subtotal (1-14)	\$ 983,630.00	\$ 1,062,320.40				\$ 97,576.35	\$ 1,159,896.75	
15	Music Compact Discs		\$ 75,000.00	28.10%	\$ 53,925.00	\$ 58,239.00		3,950	\$ 2.34	\$ 9,243.00	\$ 67,482.00	
16	DVD's		\$ 300,000.00	32.10%	\$ 203,700.00	\$ 219,996.00		10,000	\$ 1.88	\$ 18,800.00	\$ 238,796.00	
17	Spoken Word Audio		\$ 100,000.00	46.40%	\$ 53,600.00	\$ 57,888.00	10	2,225	\$ 3.14	\$ 6,986.50	\$ 64,874.50	
18	Music Scores		\$ 10,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		N/A	N/A	N/A	N/A	
				Subtotal (15-18)	\$ 311,225.00	\$ 336,123.00			Subtotal (15-18)	\$ 35,029.50	\$ 371,152.50	
				Total Section 1.1:	\$ 1,294,855.00	\$ 1,398,443.40			Total Section 1.2:	\$ 132,605.85	\$ 1,531,049.25	
		1	Vendor wrote, "Category I, Att 3"									
		2	Vendor wrote, "Category III, Att 3"									
		3	Vendor wrote, "Category IX, Att 3"									
		4	Vendor wrote, "Category VII, Att 3"									
		5	Vendor wrote, "Category V, Att 3"									
		6	Vendor wrote, "Category II, Att 3"									
		7	Vendor wrote, "Category IV, Att 3"									
		8	Vendor wrote, "Category XIII, Att 3"									
		9	Vendor wrote, "Category VII, Att 3"									
		10	Vendor wrote, "Category XII, Att 3"									
		**	Vendor wrote, "Titles which receive minimal publisher discount will be invoiced at publisher's list price.									

Bid Tabulation									
ITB 10056901-15-L									
Baker & Taylor			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services		
			Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price					Est Ann Price for Processing of a Single Item	
Item No	Type of Material		% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Quantity Number of Items	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
		***	Vendor wrote, "The discount will apply to popular, trade editions issued by widely distributed publishers. Other Large Print editions will be discounted as outlined in Attachment 2, Categories IX and XI."						

Bid Tabulation									
ITB 10056901-15-L									
Brodart Company		Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax	Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	46.50%	\$ 133,750.00	\$ 144,450.00	8,900	\$ 2.00	\$ 17,800.00	\$ 162,250.00
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	46.50%	\$ 133,750.00	\$ 144,450.00	9,615	\$ 1.45	\$ 13,941.75	\$ 158,391.75
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.00%	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 62,640.00	6,200	\$ 3.70	\$ 22,940.00	\$ 85,580.00
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	42.00%	\$ 174,000.00	\$ 187,920.00	14,285	\$ 3.70	\$ 52,854.50	\$ 240,774.50
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	11.00%	\$ 44,500.00	\$ 48,060.00	2,500	\$ 1.45	\$ 3,625.00	\$ 51,685.00
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	11.00%	\$ 89,000.00	\$ 96,120.00	1,750	\$ 1.45	\$ 2,537.50	\$ 98,657.50
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	46.50%	\$ 16,050.00	\$ 17,334.00	1,200	\$ 1.45	\$ 1,740.00	\$ 19,074.00
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	23.00%	\$ 15,400.00	\$ 16,632.00	1,120	\$ 1.45	\$ 1,624.00	\$ 18,256.00
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	42.00%	\$ 23,200.00	\$ 25,056.00	5,000	\$ 0.35	\$ 1,750.00	\$ 26,806.00
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	46.50%	\$ 107,000.00	\$ 115,560.00	9,500	\$ 1.85	\$ 17,575.00	\$ 133,135.00
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.00%	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 62,640.00	8,700	\$ 3.70	\$ 32,190.00	\$ 94,830.00
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	46.50%	\$ 8,025.00	\$ 8,667.00	2,100	\$ 0.65	\$ 1,365.00	\$ 10,032.00
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	23.00%	\$ 107,800.00	\$ 116,424.00	5,900	\$ 1.45	\$ 8,555.00	\$ 124,979.00
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	42.00%	\$ 17,400.00	\$ 18,792.00	4,250	\$ 0.35	\$ 1,487.50	\$ 20,279.50

[illegible]

Bid Tabulation									
ITB 10056901-15-L									
Ingram Library Services		Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax	Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	48.00%	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 140,400.00	8,900	\$ 1.50	\$ 13,350.00	\$ 153,750.00
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	48.00%	\$ 130,000.00	\$ 140,400.00	9,615	\$ 0.93	\$ 8,941.95	\$ 149,341.95
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.00%	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 62,640.00	6,200	\$ 2.68	\$ 16,616.00	\$ 79,256.00
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	42.00%	\$ 174,000.00	\$ 187,920.00	14,285	\$ 2.68	\$ 38,283.80	\$ 226,203.80
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	15.00%	\$ 42,500.00	\$ 45,900.00	2,500	\$ 0.93	\$ 2,325.00	\$ 48,225.00
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	15.00%	\$ 85,000.00	\$ 91,800.00	1,750	\$ 0.93	\$ 1,627.50	\$ 93,427.50
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	15.00%	\$ 25,500.00	\$ 27,540.00	1,200	\$ 0.93	\$ 1,116.00	\$ 28,656.00
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	18.00%	\$ 16,400.00	\$ 17,712.00	1,120	\$ 0.93	\$ 1,041.60	\$ 18,753.60
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	42.00%	\$ 23,200.00	\$ 25,056.00	5,000	\$ 0.25	\$ 1,250.00	\$ 26,306.00
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	48.00%	\$ 104,000.00	\$ 112,320.00	9,500	\$ 1.35	\$ 12,825.00	\$ 125,145.00
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	42.00%	\$ 58,000.00	\$ 62,640.00	8,700	\$ 2.68	\$ 23,316.00	\$ 85,956.00
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	18.00%	\$ 12,300.00	\$ 13,284.00	2,100	\$ 0.63	\$ 1,323.00	\$ 14,607.00
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	18.00%	\$ 114,800.00	\$ 123,984.00	5,900	\$ 0.93	\$ 5,487.00	\$ 129,471.00
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	42.00%	\$ 17,400.00	\$ 18,792.00	4,250	\$ 0.25	\$ 1,062.50	\$ 19,854.50

[illegible]

Bid Tabulation									
ITB 10056901-15-L									
Cengage Learning		Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax	Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	0.00%	\$ 250,000.00	\$ 270,000.00	8,900	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 270,000.00
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	0.00%	\$ 250,000.00	\$ 270,000.00	9,615	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 270,000.00
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	0.00%	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 108,000.00	6,200	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 108,000.00
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	0.00%	\$ 300,000.00	\$ 324,000.00	14,285	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 324,000.00
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	0.00%	\$ 50,000.00	\$ 54,000.00	2,500	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 54,000.00
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	0.00%	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 108,000.00	1,750	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 108,000.00
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	20.00%	\$ 24,000.00	\$ 25,920.00	1,200	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 25,920.00
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	0.00%	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 21,600.00	1,120	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 21,600.00
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	0.00%	\$ 40,000.00	\$ 43,200.00	5,000	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 43,200.00
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	0.00%	\$ 200,000.00	\$ 216,000.00	9,500	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 216,000.00
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	0.00%	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 108,000.00	8,700	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 108,000.00
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1 2,100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	0.00%	\$ 140,000.00	\$ 151,200.00	5,900	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 151,200.00
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	0.00%	\$ 30,000.00	\$ 32,400.00	4,250	\$ -	\$ -	\$ 32,400.00

[illegible]

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Center Point Large			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		6,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		14,285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,750	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	40.00%	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 19,440.00	1	1,200	\$ 22.15	\$ 26,580.00	2 No Bid
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		4,250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Center Point Large			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material		Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax	Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
				Subtotal (1-14)	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 19,440.00			\$ 26,580.00	\$ 46,020.00
15	Music Compact Discs		\$ 75,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3,950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
16	DVD's		\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
17	Spoken Word Audio		\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2,225	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
18	Music Scores		\$ 10,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	<i>N/A</i>	<i>N/A</i>	<i>N/A</i>	No Bid
				Subtotal (15-18)	\$ -	\$ -		Subtotal (15-18)	\$ -	\$ -
				Total Section 1.1:	\$ 18,000.00	\$ 19,440.00		Total Section 1.2:	\$ 26,580.00	\$ 46,020.00
		1	Vendor wrote: "40% disc free shipping"							
		2	Vendor wrote: "see attached"							
			Vendor wrote at bottom of Pricing page number 30, "** San Diego Library currently does NOT ask for processing"							

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Theodore Front			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		6,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		14,285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,750	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		4,250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Theodore Front			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax	Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2	
			Subtotal (1-14)	\$ -	\$ -			\$ -	\$ -	
15	Music Compact Discs	\$ 75,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	3,950	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
16	DVD's	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
17	Spoken Word Audio	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	2,225	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	
18	Music Scores	\$ 10,000.00	10.00%	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,720.00	N/A	N/A	N/A	\$ 9,720.00	
			Subtotal (15-18)	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,720.00		Subtotal (15-18)	\$ -	\$ 9,720.00	
			Total Section 1.1:	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 9,720.00		Total Section 1.2:	\$ -	\$ 9,720.00	
		Vendor wrote at bottom of Pricing page number 30, "** San Diego Library currently does NOT ask for processing"								

Bid Tabulation											
ITB 10056901-15-L											
Midwest Tape			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services				
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees		Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	8,900	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	9,615	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	6,200	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	14,285	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	2,500	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	1,750	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	1,200	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	1,120	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	5,000	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	9,500	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	8,700	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	2,100	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	5,900	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	4,250	No Bid	No Bid	1	No Bid

Bid Tabulation											
ITB 10056901-15-L											
Midwest Tape			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services				
Item No	Type of Material		Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
				Subtotal (1-14)	\$ -	\$ -				\$ -	\$ -
15	Music Compact Discs		\$ 75,000.00	25.00%	\$ 56,250.00	\$ 60,750.00	*	3,950	\$ 2.95	\$ 11,652.50	2 \$ 72,402.50
16	DVD's		\$ 300,000.00	30.00%	\$ 210,000.00	\$ 226,800.00		10,000	\$ 3.50	\$ 35,000.00	2 \$ 261,800.00
17	Spoken Word Audio		\$ 100,000.00	0.00%	\$ 100,000.00	\$ 108,000.00	**	2,225	\$ 2.95	\$ 6,563.75	3 \$ 114,563.75
18	Music Scores		\$ 10,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1	N/A	N/A	N/A	No Bid
				Subtotal (15-18)	\$ 366,250.00	\$ 395,550.00			Subtotal (15-18)	\$ 53,216.25	\$ 448,766.25
				Total Section 1.1:	\$ 366,250.00	\$ 395,550.00			Total Section 1.2:	\$ 53,216.25	\$ 448,766.25
		1	Vendor wrote: "Format N/A to Midwest Tape"								
		2	Vendor wrote: "/single disc"								
		3	Vendor wrote: "flat rate"								
		*	Vendor added an asterick, but no comments								
		**	Vendor wrote: "Sold at Retail Price with case at no charge."								

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Blackstone Audio			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		6,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		14,285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,750	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		4,250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]

Bid Tabulation										
ITB 10056901-15-L										
Recorded Books			Section 1.1: Materials Pricing				Section 1.2: Processing Services			
Item No	Type of Material	Est Ann Expenditure by SDPL Based on Publisher's List Price	% Discount off Publisher's List Price	Total Annual Pricing	Total Annual Pricing Inc 8% Sales Tax		Est Ann Quantity Number of Items	Price for Processing of a Single Item	Extended Pricing for Processing Fees	Totals Sections 1.1 (Inc Sales Tax) and 1.2
1	Adult Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
2	Adult Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 250,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,615	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
3	Adult Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		6,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
4	Adult Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 300,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		14,285	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Small Press Books	\$ 50,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Technical & Textbooks	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,750	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
7	Large Print Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,200	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Adult Publisher's Library Bindings	\$ 20,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		1,120	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
9	Adult Mass Market Paperbacks	\$ 40,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,000	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
10	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Hardcover Books	\$ 200,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		9,500	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
11	Juvenile &YA Fiction & Non Fiction Trade Paperback Books	\$ 100,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		8,700	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
12	Board Books	\$ 15,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		2,100	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13	Juvenile &YA Publisher's Library Bindings Trade Paperback Books	\$ 140,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		5,900	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14	Juvenile &YA Mass Market Paperbacks Trade Paperback Books	\$ 30,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid		4,250	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

[illegible]